



MIDAMERICA ST. LOUIS AIRPORT: BID TABULATION
 Solicitation No. 2017-17
 Runway and Aircraft Deicing Materials
 September 5, 2017; 2:30 p.m.

BIDDER NAME & ADDRESS <i>(in order of receipt)</i>	1. Liquid Runway Deicer (potassium acetate) <i>per gallon</i>			2. Type I Aircraft Deicing/ Anti-Icing Fluid <i>per gallon</i>			3. Type IV Aircraft Deicing/ Anti-Icing Fluid <i>per gallon</i>			4a. Solid Runway Deicer <i>per LB for 55lb bag</i>			4b. Solid Runway Deicer <i>per LB for 2,205lb bulk bag</i>		
	YR 1: 2017-2018	YR 2: 2018-2019	YR 3: 2019-2020	YR 1: 2017-2018	YR 2: 2018-2019	YR 3: 2019-2020	YR 1: 2017-2018	YR 2: 2018-2019	YR 3: 2019-2020	YR 1: 2017-2018	YR 2: 2018-2019	YR 3: 2019-2020	YR 1: 2017-2018	YR 2: 2018-2019	YR 3: 2019-2020
1 Schoenberg Salt Co., Inc. PO Box 128 Oceanside, NY 11572	\$4.13	\$4.13	\$4.13	No Bid			No Bid			\$0.82	\$0.83	\$0.85	\$0.82	\$0.83	\$0.85
2 Cryotech Deicing Technology 6103 Orthoway Fort Madison, IA 52627	\$4.58	\$4.58	\$4.58	\$4.124	\$4.244	\$4.354	\$6.69	\$6.83	\$6.94	\$0.958636	\$0.958636	\$0.958636	\$0.93424	\$0.93424	\$0.93424
3 Ascent Aviation Group LLC 1 Mill Street Parish, NY 13131	\$4.19	\$4.29	\$4.59	\$4.29	\$4.59	\$4.79	\$8.69	\$8.99	\$9.19	No Bid			No Bid		